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Alonza S. Barnhart

. .Alanzo Scott Barnhart of
Ncedmore, 83, ..husband of
the late Laura Siffel ..Barnj
hart, died on Friday at 6:35
p.m. aj the .Fulton -county
Medical .Center. -Born .m
Washington county, he was
the son of the late . Palmer,
and Frances ..Bailey .Barn-
hart - •

He was a farmer and ma
chinist and a member of the
Uakley Christian church. ..
. . He is survived by the fol
lowing children: Mrs. Gene
va B. Bishop, Big Cove Tan
nery, Mrs. Madaline . Hen-
dershot, Clear Spring, Mrs.
Ruth Holler, Gerard, Ohio,
Mrs. Stella Hendershot, of
Warfordsburg, Bernard P.,
of Needmore, Fred V., of
Sharpsburg, 25 grand chil
dren, 20 great grand chil
dren, one sister, Mi's- Mar-

•tha Jane Lay ton of War
fordsburg.

Funeral service was held
Monday at 2 p.m. at Grove
funeral home in Hancock,
with Rev. Richard Newkirk
officiating. Burial was made
in Oakley Christian ceme
tery.


